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Event Planning & Information Privacy

Events, Meetings and Conferences

Planning for  Privacy
Privacy is a growing concern for businesses of all sizes. 
Meetings and conferences can involve a variety of 
sensitive topics including corporate strategy, mergers 
and acquisitions, executive terminations, or other 
negotiations to name a few. Security for these discussions 
needs to be taken seriously by all those involved. 

When planning for meetings and events, organizers 
should take into consideration the confidential nature 
of the various activities and conversations that will 
occur. Many sensitive meetings will take place at off-site 
locations such as hotels or conference centers. Not all 
of these locations will have the level of security found in 
the corporate offices. Additional attention and protection 
will be required for these areas. 

Exec Security specializes in technical surveillance 
countermeasures (TSCM), often referred to as electronic 

Significant Meeting Concerns

•	 Board of Directors Meetings

•	 Shareholder Meetings

•	 Senior Leadership Events

•	 Executive Travel Plans

•	 Union Negotiations

•	 Mergers and Acquisitions 

•	 Corporate Strategy

Critical Locations for Sweeps

•	 Conference Facilities

•	 Event Meeting Rooms

•	 Hotel Suites

•	 Private Dining Areas

•	 Convention Centers

•	 Resorts and Clubs

•	 Transportation: Aircraft & Vehicles

bug sweeps. TSCM is the practice of detecting, 
uncovering, and preventing eavesdropping threats and 
unauthorized surveillance. Professional TSCM requires 
knowledge of data and communications systems and an 
understanding infrastructure vulnerabilities. We use the 
most advanced professional detection equipment and 
the highest information security practices to support our 
clients. We have worked with companies in a variety of 
industries; from small start-ups to large manufacturing 
firms and Fortune 100 corporations. 

No matter what industry your organization is in, 
information leaks could be devastating. Such loss can 
directly affect stock value, hurt negotiations, and lead to 
loss of trade secrets. It could also put executives’ safety 
at risk, and damage corporate reputation. You can trust 
Exec Security TSCM to help secure your conferences, 
meetings, and special events.


